




 

 Detailed Summary 

The following information is to provide the contract number (if applicable) and more specific details of the 
issues noted with each contract review. 
 

1. We noted during our review of the Department of Environmental Protection’s (Department) Contract 
Resource Guide, it does not provide adequate guidance to Contract Managers regarding monitoring 
deliverables and contractor performance. The Guide includes the completion of a risk assessment and 
informs the Contract Managers that a monitoring plan would need to be completed. It also lists examples of 
monitoring activities; however, it does not provide additional guidance such as monitoring the receipt of 
deliverables or a monitoring tool to use for documenting their monitoring efforts. Upon reviewing the 
documentation submitted by the Department’s Contract Managers and the agency’s point of contact, a risk 
assessment and monitoring plan were not submitted for our review. 
 
Also, there was no monitoring documentation for two (2) of the six (6) contracts reviewed (GC121 & 
ES007). The remaining four (4) contracts (CN470, HW687, LPA0057, NS031) have evidence that some 
form of monitoring was performed; however, the monitoring documentation needs improvement. For 
example, a monitoring tool should be completed, and monitoring conclusions should be documented to 
show the Department’s monitoring efforts.  
 
Finally, the Department procedures “Contract Resource Guide” references Chief Financial Officer (CFO) 
Memorandum Number (No.) 5 and provides some guidance on what types of monitoring to perform and 
suggested frequencies. However, the guide should be revised to include directions regarding how to perform 
monitoring and the documentation required to demonstrate their monitoring efforts.  
 
To comply with CFO Memorandum No. 5, adequate monitoring procedures must be in place. Contract 
Manager’s monitoring efforts are critical to ensure deliverables are received with sufficient performance 
demonstrated. With the use of monitoring tools, the Contract Manager is able to sufficiently document their 
monitoring of the deliverables and performance of a contractor. The tool can also be used to monitor the 
contract’s budget to ensure funds are not over-drawn and expended. 
 

2. We noted during our review of contract numbers LPA0057 and NS031, that their closeout documentation 
submitted did not indicate that a final reconciliation was performed. The Contract Manager for NS031 and 
LPA0057 referred to the Closeout Checklist as the final reconciliation report in their response to our audit 
questions. Upon review of the checklists, we were unable to locate where a final reconciliation of funds was 
performed. The checklist was composed of five (5) questions that pertain to their agency’s closeout process; 
however, none of those questions referred to a completion of a final reconciliation report. 
 
Without performing a final reconciliation of funds after a contract close-out, the agency would not be able 
to verify the funds expended did not exceed the allowable contract amount and cause an over-payment. 

 
3. We noted during our review of contract number GC121, that invoice number “121-Jun22” did not have a 

written certification from the Contract Manager stating the deliverables or performance of the contractor 
was completed. This is a task implemented by the Department by adding to invoices a section (section E) 
specifically for the Department to use. In this section, the Contract Manager fills out invoice received and 
approved dates, the service period, whether they met satisfactory performance, and a signature/date line. 
Since invoice number “121-Jun22” only had a receive date, approve date, and service date we could not 
determine whether the Contract Manager performed a review of the invoice. Without the Contract 
Manager’s signature certifying the invoice, there is no documentation or certification a review was 
performed. We noted that this section was completed by Contract Managers for other invoices we reviewed.      
 
Without providing a written certification from the Contract Manager that the goods and services were 
satisfactorily received, the agency would not be able to confirm that the deliverables on the invoice were 
received and approved before payment was made.   



 
4. We noted during our review of contract number CN470, we could not locate a receive date to determine 

whether the invoice was approved for payment within five (5) working days. The Contract Manager 
digitally signed and dated the certificate for payment, which is located on the last page of the invoice. We 
used the date of the signature as the date of approval; however, we could not determine how many working 
days had lapsed from the invoice receive date. 
 
Without recording the date invoices are received, the agency would be unable to determine whether the 
agency is in accordance with the 5-day requirement per section (s.) 215.422, Florida Statutes (F.S.).   

 
5. We noted during our review of contract number HW687, that the contractor had travel expenses in the 

invoices we reviewed. The vehicle rates are established in the contract as fixed prices and the Department 
of Environmental Protection Cost Estimate form shows authorized expenses for hotel and per diem. Based 
on our conversations with the Department, it is our understanding that travel expenses are approved 
beforehand when the task assignment is approved; therefore, the documentation for the authorized travel 
should have been maintained and include the required documentation per s. 112.061, F.S. During our 
review, we did not locate travel authorization documentation to confirm that the travel was authorized. 
 
Without appropriate supporting documentation for travel expenses, we are unable to determine whether the 
contractor and the Department were in accordance with s. 112.061. F.S.   
 

 
 




